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Lincoln Kindergarten Letters to Santa
Mrs. Babcock’s Class

Dear Santa,
My name is Archer.  I am 

five years old.  I love cars 
and I have a big dog.  I live 
in Lincoln.  I don’t have a 
chimney so you’ll have to 
come in the door.  This year 
I have been really happy!  I 
would really like it if you 
could bring me a bubble 
machine, a race track, and a 
watch.  What is your favor-
ite cookie, Santa?  Thank 
you and Merry Christmas!
Love, Archer

Dear Santa,
My name is Brylee.  I am 

six years old.  I have a pet 
dog named Spanky.  He is 
cuddly and friendly.  I live 
in Lincoln in a big, white 
house.  This year I have 
been super good!  I am re-
ally nice to other kids.   I 
would really like it if you 
could bring me a real 
phone, make up, and Elsa 
stuff.   Santa, does Mrs. 
Claus make your clothes?  
Thank you and Merry 
Christmas!
Love, Brylee

Dear Santa,
My name is Brooklyn.  I 

am five years old.  My fa-
vorite colors are pink, blue, 
and purple.  I have four 
people in my family and a 
dog named Duke.  I live in 
Lincoln in a white house.  
This year I have been real-
ly nice!  I would really like 
if if you could bring me a 
plushie, an LOL doll, and a 
costume with a tail.  Santa, 
do reindeer like cookies, 
too?  Thank you and Merry 
Christmas!
Love, Brooklyn

Dear Santa, 
My name is Corbin.  I am 

five years old.  My favorite 
colors are green and red.  I 
have four dogs.  Three are 
nice, but one is bad.  I live 
in a green and gray house 
in Lincoln.  There are bikes 
outside.  This year I have 
been really good!  I would 
really like it if you could 
bring me a remote control 
drone, two guitars, and my 
own Spidey chair. How do 
you deliver presents, Santa, 
I like you!  Thank you and 
Merry Christmas!
Love, Corbin

Dear Santa,
My name is Daxton.  I 

am five years old.  I like 
to play games.  My favor-
ite is checkers.  Yellow is 
my favorite color.  I have 
four people in my family.  
I live in a green house in 
Lincoln.   I don’t have a 
chimney.  This year I have 
been really nice!  I would 
really like it if you could 
bring me a race car, remote 
control tractor, and a trash 
truck.  How do reindeer 
fly, Santa?  Thank you and 
Merry Christmas!
Love, Daxton

Dear Santa,
My name is Emilia.  I am 

six years old.  My favorite 
game to play outside is hide 
and seek.  My favorite food 
is carrots.  I like playing 
with my cat, Mo, and I love 
my mom, dad, pets, and 
brothers so much.   I live 
in a cream colored house 
with a black roof and ga-
rage in Lincoln.  This year 
I have been really kind!  I 
would really like it if you 
could bring me a new tab-
let, a xylophone, and a cat 
stuffed animal.  Santa, how 
do reindeer fly?  How do 
you  bring us gifts?  Thank 
you and Merry Christmas!  

Love, Emilia

Dear Santa,
My name is Everett.  I am 

five years old.  I like foot-
ball, combines, my family, 
and my mom’s dogs.  This 
year I have been really 
good!  I live in the country 
in a brick house on a farm 
and in town Lincoln in a 
yellow house.  This year I 
have been really good!  I 
would really like it if you 
could bring me a tablet, 
farm stuff, and football 
stuff.  Santa, how do rein-
deer fly?  I like you!  Thank 
you and Merry Christmas!
Love, Everett

Dear Santa, 
My name is Halston.  I am 

five years old.  I like doing 
fun things and going on 
trips.  I have cats that are 
really cute.   My house is in 
the country and it’s really 
big and brown. This year 
I have been really good!  I 
would really like it if you 
could bring me hot wheels 
city, a tiger shark monster 
truck, and a trash truck toy.  
Santa, how do reindeer fly?  
How many cookies can you 
eat?  Thank you and Merry 
Christmas!
Love, Halston

Dear Santa,
My name is Harold.  I am 

five years old.  I have three 
pigs named Pork Chop, 
Crispy Bacon, and Bacon.  
I also have a dog named 
Bruce.    I live in the coun-
try in a white house with a 
blue roof.  This year I have 
been really good!  I would 
really like it if you could 
bring me a toy camp set 
and two hound dogs.  San-
ta, how fast do you drive 
your sleigh?  Thank you 
and Merry Christmas!

Love, Harold

Dear Santa,
My name is Ian.  I am six 

years old.  I have three dogs 
named Lacey, Vice, and 
Teddy Bear..  I like school.   
I live in a big red house. 
This year I have been re-
ally good!  I would really 
like it if you could bring me 
a T-Rex, a green truck, and 
a green teddy bear.  Santa, 
how do you give out all the 
toys in one night?  Thank 
you and Merry Christmas!
Love, Ian

Dear Santa,
My name is Isaiah.  I am 

five years old.  I like Mine-
craft.  My dog likes me 
very much.  I live in Lin-
coln in a house with a red 
roof.  This year I have been 
really good!  I would really 
like it if you could bring me 
animal plushies, toys, and 
Minecraft Metals.  Santa, 
do the reindeer like car-
rots?  Thank you and Merry 
Christmas!
Love, Isaiah

Dear Santa,
My name is Iva.  I am 

six years old.  I like play-
ing with my friends.  I love 
my mom!  I have kittens 
and they are so cute.  I live 
in the country in a white 
house.  We have cows by 
our house.  This year I 
have been really good!  I 
would really like it if you 
could bring me a pet dog, a 
baby pony, and a pet bunny.  
How do you make so many 
toys, Santa?
Thank you and Merry 

Christmas!
Love, Iva 

Dear Santa,
My name is Konstance.  I 

am five years old.  I love 

my cat, Sunny, and my 
family.  I live in a long, 
blue house.  This year I 
have been kind!  I would 
really like it if you could 
bring me a pink teddy bear, 
a tablet, and a cat pillow 
and blanket.  Santa, what is 
your favorite cookie?
Thank you and Merry 

Christmas!
Love, Konstance

Dear Santa,
My name is Leslie.  I am 

five years old.  My favor-
ite color is purple and my 
favorite animal is an ele-
phant.  I have pet dogs and 
cows.  I have a sister and a 
brother.  I live in Lincoln 
in a yellow house and my 
mom’s white truck will be 
outside.  This year I have 
been really good!  I would 
really like it if you could 
bring me a new pencil box, 
a new bookbag, and a new 
bed.  Do the reindeer have 
horns, Santa?  Thank you 
and Merry Christmas!
Love, Leslie

Dear Santa,
My name is Lillian.  I 

am five years old.  I have 
a cat named Scratcher be-
cause he scratches.  I love 
to dance.  I live in Lincoln 
in a big green house.  This 
year I have been really 
good!  I would really like 
it if you could bring me an 
Elsa doll, Barbie stuff, and 
a white dog. Santa, how do 
the reindeer fly?  Thank 
you and Merry Christmas!
Love, Lillian

Dear Santa,
My name is Nova.  I am 

six years old.  My favor-
ite color is purple.  I like 
jumping on my trampo-
line.  My dog likes to go 
outside and play catch.  I 

live in Lincoln in a green 
house and it says Hamel.  It 
doesn’t have a chimney so 
you’ll have to use the door.  
This year I have been really 
good!  I would really like it 
if you could bring me a toy 
purple truck, purple pens, 
and a purple notebook.  Do 
the reindeer run outside, 
Santa?  Thank you and 
Merry Christmas!
Love, Nova

Dear Santa,
My name is Sadix.  I am 

five years old.  I like to 
play games.  I am funny 
and smart.  My family and 
pets love me, too!  I live 
in a big, white house in 
Lincoln.  This year I have 
been really nice and good!  
I would really like it if 
you could give me a game 
chair, games, and a monitor 
that’s small so I can play 
games on it.  Santa, does 
Mrs. Claus help Santa with 
the presents?  How do the 
reindeer fly?  Thank you 
and Merry Christmas!
Love, Sadix

Dear Santa,
My name is Trent.  I am 

five years old.  I have a lit-
tle brother named Tate and 
a big sister named Luna.  I 
also have two turtles, two 
cats, and two dogs.  I live 
in Vesper in a big yellow 
house.  There is no chim-
ney so use the front side 
door beside the driveway.  
I am a good kid and have 
been really good!  I would 
really like it if you could 
bring me toy nunchucks 
with orange on the end, a 
Luigi remote control car, 
and Hot Wheels City.  Hoe 
do you go around the world 
in one night, Santa?  Thank 
you and Merry Christmas!
Love, Trent

Lincoln Farm Supply
1891 KS-Highway 18 • Lincoln, KS

(785) 524-4421

Family Hair Flair 2
(785) 524-5080

Rhonda, Rosie, Cortney, 
Evangel, and Angela wish you all a very 

Merry Christmas!

Lincoln Senior Center
116 W. Lincoln • Lincoln, Kansas

(785) 524-4738
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Lincoln Kindergarten Letters to Santa
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and I have a big dog.  I live 
in Lincoln.  I don’t have a 
chimney so you’ll have to 
come in the door.  This year 
I have been really happy!  I 
would really like it if you 
could bring me a bubble 
machine, a race track, and a 
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Love, Archer
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cuddly and friendly.  I live 
in Lincoln in a big, white 
house.  This year I have 
been super good!  I am re-
ally nice to other kids.   I 
would really like it if you 
could bring me a real 
phone, make up, and Elsa 
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in a green and gray house 
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ally good!  I would really 
like it if you could bring me 
a T-Rex, a green truck, and 
a green teddy bear.  Santa, 
how do you give out all the 
toys in one night?  Thank 
you and Merry Christmas!
Love, Ian

Dear Santa,
My name is Isaiah.  I am 

five years old.  I like Mine-
craft.  My dog likes me 
very much.  I live in Lin-
coln in a house with a red 
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the reindeer run outside, 
Santa?  Thank you and 
Merry Christmas!
Love, Nova

Dear Santa,
My name is Sadix.  I am 

five years old.  I like to 
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in a big, white house in 
Lincoln.  This year I have 
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I would really like it if 
you could give me a game 
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that’s small so I can play 
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reindeer fly?  Thank you 
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tle brother named Tate and 
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also have two turtles, two 
cats, and two dogs.  I live 
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house.  There is no chim-
ney so use the front side 
door beside the driveway.  
I am a good kid and have 
been really good!  I would 
really like it if you could 
bring me toy nunchucks 
with orange on the end, a 
Luigi remote control car, 
and Hot Wheels City.  Hoe 
do you go around the world 
in one night, Santa?  Thank 
you and Merry Christmas!
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Lincoln First Grade Letters to Santa
Mrs. Walter’s Class

Dear Santa,
Could I please have a 

racecar with a helmet? I 
have carrots for the rein-
deer. I am sleeping. How 
do you do magic in the 
sky?
Love, Drake 

Dear Santa,
Could I please have a mo-

torcycle? I am six years 
old. Do you have Rudolf?
Love, Hazel

Dear Santa,
Could I please have a big 

car set? I have a dog named 
Dottie. I am six years old. 
Why are you called Santa?
Love, Grayson

Dear Santa,
Could I please have a 

bracelet? I have nice broth-
ers. I am happy. How many 
reindeer do you have?
Love, Kimber

Dear Santa,
Could I please have a 

cat? I have a mom. I am 
six years old. Why are you 
kind?
Love, Salem

Dear Santa,
Could I please have a toy 

cat? I have a cat. I am six 
years old. What do you 
love?
Love, Ada

Dear Santa,
Could I please have a toy 

dog? I have 5 sisters. I am 
six years old. Do you have 
kids?

Love, Clara

Dear Santa,
Could I please have a big 

box of Pokemon cards? 
I have my parents. They 
help keep me safe. I am a 
Pokemon nerd. How many 
kids are on the naughty 
list?
Love, Jaxon

Dear Santa,
Could I please have a 

handle brake bike? I have 
3 sisters. I am seven years 
old. What is your favorite 
food?
Love, Jed

Dear Santa,
Could I please have a 

house tent? I have a puppy. 
I am six years old. Do you 
like cats?
Love, Brynna

Dear Santa,

Could I please have a 
puppy? I have friends. I am 
about to turn seven! What 
do your elves do?
Love, Aubrie

Dear Santa,
Could I please have a pet 

fish if you know how to 
get one? I have cats. I am 
crazy! How many kids are 
in the world?
Love, Emery

Dear Santa,
Could I please have a BB 

gun? I have a dog. I am 
good at football. What do 
you eat?
Love, Henry

Dear Santa,
Could I please have an 

RC car? I have a big stuffy. 
I am good at football. What 
is the name of the first rein-
deer?
Love, Trace

Lincoln Grocery
123 S. 4th • Lincoln, Kansas

lincolngrocery.com • (785) 524-4401

Insurance Works
Lincoln, Kansas
(785) 524-4668

USD #298
The Lincoln Board of Education wishes

everyone a happy holiday!

204 W. Lincoln Ave. • Lincoln
785-524-4649

Post Rock Cluster
United Methodist Church
Barnard • Beverly • Hunter • Lincoln
Merry Christmas and
Happy New Year!

Lincoln County Hospital
Lincoln Medical Clinic
Sylvan Medical Clinic

Wishing everyone a Safe and Happy Holiday!
www.lincolncountyhospital.net

Season’s Greeting from
Dr. Mark Luce



your socks? I am wishing 
for the Lego Hogwarts 
Castle: The Great Hall, 
the Lego Technic Wa-
ter: America Cup, Milky 
Ways, Technic Bricks, 
and Lego Bricks for 
Christmas, please. Merry 
Christmas!
Thank You, Liam

Dear Santa,
I am in 2nd grade. I 

like the Chiefs. What is 
Rudolph doing? What 
is your favorite kind of 
cookies? I would like a 
Hoverboard and a big 
sprayer drone. 
Thank You, Wyatt

Dear Santa,
I moved to a different 

house. How are you? 
How do the reindeer fly? 
I would like a robot dog, 
please!
Love, Owyn

Dear Santa,
I have 3 siblings. I have 

1 brother and 2 sisters. 
We live in town. Did you 
give the elves magic? 
How lone have you been 
delivering presents? May 
I have a Squishmallow, a 
bird, a new puppy, and a 
computer? Merry Christ-
mas!
Thank You, Kinsley

SeaSon’S GreetinGSSeaSon’S GreetinGS December 18, 2024 - Page 4December 18, 2024 - Page 4LincoLn SentineLchriStmaS greetingSLincoLn SentineLchriStmaS greetingS

Lincoln Second Grade Letters to Santa
Mrs. Habiger’s Class

Dear Santa,
I am in 2nd grade. I 

love to play Legos. I love 
that you bring us Gno-
mey! What are your rein-
deer doing when it’s not 
Christmas? How are you 
doing? What are your fa-
vorite cookies? I would 
love two kittens please. I 
would love Legos, Twix, 
and maybe some more ar-
rows! Merry Christmas! 
Ho Ho Ho
Love, Luna

Dear Santa,
I like calico cats. I love 

Rudolph the Red Nose 
Reindeer. How is Ru-
dolph? How are all of 
the reindeer? I am wish-
ing for a Rudolph book 
bag, winter clothes for 
my Rudolph, a calico cat 
Squishmallow, a Magic 
Bunnies Surprise, and a 
picture of Rudolph.
Thank You, Christina

Dear Santa,
I love to catch snakes. I 

love holding my gecko. 
How do you make toys? 
Where did you get the 
elves? I want an Amazon 
gift card and a picture of 
Rudolph. 
Merry Christmas, Xylan

Dear Santa,
I’m in 2nd grade. My 

name is Noah. I love my 
family. Where were you 
born? Why did you make 
your job? I am wishing 
for a metal pool, toy trac-
tor, and a Hoverboard. 
Merry Christmas Santa!
Thank You, Noah

Dear Santa,
I like to play soccer. I will 

put out milk and cookies 
with a toy. I love to play 
with my friends. How do 
your reindeer fly? What is 
the North Pole like? Is it 
cold? I love you! I want 
a puppy, a kitten, DQ gift 
card, a desk with a back-
pack and the set, and a 
Disney Land gift card. 
Merry Christmas!
Thank You, Lillyanna

Dear Santa,
I am in school a lot. I 

love going outside. Is 
Rudolph the captain? I 
would like a truck and 
a drone. I would like a 
remote-control monster 
truck. Merry Christmas!
Thank You, Jordy

Dear Santa,
I have been helping my 

mom a lot. I am in 2nd 
grade. How do reindeer 
fly? How many toys do 
the elves make? I would 

like aa Nintendo Switch, 
Amazon gift card, and 
an Apple watch. Merry 
Christmas!
Thank you, Daniel

Dear Santa,
I am in 2nd grade. I will 

give you milk and cook-
ies. Is Mrs. Claus real? 
How many reindeer do 
you have? I wish for a 
Hoverboard, a phone, and 
an Apple watch. Merry 
Christmas!
Thank you, AJ

Dear Santa,
I like to play with my 

cat. I will leave milk and 
cookies for you. How is 
Santa? I am wishing for 
Magic Tree House books, 
a Squishmallow, and a 
jewelry box. 
Thank You, Mayple

Dear Santa,
I am in 2nd grade at 

L.E.S.. I will leave you 
milk and cookies. Am I 
on the naughty list? How 
is Dasher and the other 
reindeer and elves? I am 
wishing for a King Kong 
Punching Kong toy, Mec-
ca King Kong toy, Mecca 
Godzilla Heat Breath toy, 
and Godzilla Heat Breath 
toy, please. Merry Christ-
mas! Ho Ho Ho
Love You, Ronin

Dear Santa,
I am in 2nd grade at 

L.E.S.. I will leave you 
milk and cookies. How 
are you doing? How many 
toys do the elves make? I 
am wishing for another 
doll. I am wishing for an-
other dog toy for my dog.
Thank You Santa, Emma

Dear Santa,
I like to play with Poke-

mon. I am in 2nd grade at 
L.E.S. and it is fun. How 
old are the reindeer? How 
many elves are in the 
North Pole? I am wish-
ing for a x-box, Dogman 
books, and a dirt bike.
Thank You,Weston

Dear Santa,
I like to watch Grey’s 

Anatomy. I am very help-
ful when Keith needs help. 
How old are you? How do 
you make the sleigh fly? I 
am wishing for an Apple 
watch, iphone 15, laptop, 
Bluetooth headphones, 
more Hooky books, and 
more cats, please. Merry 
Christmas!
Thank You, Addy

Dear Santa,
I love cookies. I love 

milk. How do the rein-
deer fly? How do you stay 
warm? Please bring me a 

Hoverboard. Please bring 
me a phone. Please bring 
me money.
Thank You, Luke

Dear Santa,
I love books. I love bak-

ing cookies. What hap-
pened to my elf on the 
shelf? How are the rein-
deer? I am wishing for a 
Nintendo Switch, a new 
pair of Nikes, and a new 
elf on the shelf next year. 
Merry Christmas!
Thank You, Jamison

Dear Santa,
I like the Chiefs. I am in 

2nd grade. What do you 
feed the reindeer? How 
many elves are there? I 
want the Lego Harry Pot-
ter train, a Lego Tracker, 
Legos, and books, please.
Thank You, Braxten

Dear Santa,
I like to play my PS5. 

I watch K-State. How 
many reindeer do you 
have? What is our favor-
ite movie? I want a mil-
lion dollars. I want Re-
ese’s.
Love, Axl

Dear Santa,
I am reading the Harry 

Potter books. I love to 
read! How old are you? 
Does Mrs. Claus knit 

Season’s Greetings from
Dr. Grant Heller

414 S. 6th • Lincoln, Kansas
(785) 524-4107

Susan Marshall,
Attorney at Law

145 E. Lincoln Ave. • Lincoln, Kansas
(785) 524-4431

G. Kyle Gwinner, 
Optometrist

Lincoln, Kansas
(785) 524-5244

Beloit, Lincoln, Mankato, and Osborne
Member NCUA

Mity Mart
1903 E. Hwy 18 • Lincoln, Kansas

(785) 524-4544



your socks? I am wishing 
for the Lego Hogwarts 
Castle: The Great Hall, 
the Lego Technic Wa-
ter: America Cup, Milky 
Ways, Technic Bricks, 
and Lego Bricks for 
Christmas, please. Merry 
Christmas!
Thank You, Liam

Dear Santa,
I am in 2nd grade. I 

like the Chiefs. What is 
Rudolph doing? What 
is your favorite kind of 
cookies? I would like a 
Hoverboard and a big 
sprayer drone. 
Thank You, Wyatt

Dear Santa,
I moved to a different 

house. How are you? 
How do the reindeer fly? 
I would like a robot dog, 
please!
Love, Owyn

Dear Santa,
I have 3 siblings. I have 

1 brother and 2 sisters. 
We live in town. Did you 
give the elves magic? 
How lone have you been 
delivering presents? May 
I have a Squishmallow, a 
bird, a new puppy, and a 
computer? Merry Christ-
mas!
Thank You, Kinsley
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Lincoln Second Grade Letters to Santa
Mrs. Habiger’s Class

Dear Santa,
I am in 2nd grade. I 

love to play Legos. I love 
that you bring us Gno-
mey! What are your rein-
deer doing when it’s not 
Christmas? How are you 
doing? What are your fa-
vorite cookies? I would 
love two kittens please. I 
would love Legos, Twix, 
and maybe some more ar-
rows! Merry Christmas! 
Ho Ho Ho
Love, Luna

Dear Santa,
I like calico cats. I love 

Rudolph the Red Nose 
Reindeer. How is Ru-
dolph? How are all of 
the reindeer? I am wish-
ing for a Rudolph book 
bag, winter clothes for 
my Rudolph, a calico cat 
Squishmallow, a Magic 
Bunnies Surprise, and a 
picture of Rudolph.
Thank You, Christina

Dear Santa,
I love to catch snakes. I 

love holding my gecko. 
How do you make toys? 
Where did you get the 
elves? I want an Amazon 
gift card and a picture of 
Rudolph. 
Merry Christmas, Xylan

Dear Santa,
I’m in 2nd grade. My 

name is Noah. I love my 
family. Where were you 
born? Why did you make 
your job? I am wishing 
for a metal pool, toy trac-
tor, and a Hoverboard. 
Merry Christmas Santa!
Thank You, Noah

Dear Santa,
I like to play soccer. I will 

put out milk and cookies 
with a toy. I love to play 
with my friends. How do 
your reindeer fly? What is 
the North Pole like? Is it 
cold? I love you! I want 
a puppy, a kitten, DQ gift 
card, a desk with a back-
pack and the set, and a 
Disney Land gift card. 
Merry Christmas!
Thank You, Lillyanna

Dear Santa,
I am in school a lot. I 

love going outside. Is 
Rudolph the captain? I 
would like a truck and 
a drone. I would like a 
remote-control monster 
truck. Merry Christmas!
Thank You, Jordy

Dear Santa,
I have been helping my 

mom a lot. I am in 2nd 
grade. How do reindeer 
fly? How many toys do 
the elves make? I would 

like aa Nintendo Switch, 
Amazon gift card, and 
an Apple watch. Merry 
Christmas!
Thank you, Daniel

Dear Santa,
I am in 2nd grade. I will 

give you milk and cook-
ies. Is Mrs. Claus real? 
How many reindeer do 
you have? I wish for a 
Hoverboard, a phone, and 
an Apple watch. Merry 
Christmas!
Thank you, AJ

Dear Santa,
I like to play with my 

cat. I will leave milk and 
cookies for you. How is 
Santa? I am wishing for 
Magic Tree House books, 
a Squishmallow, and a 
jewelry box. 
Thank You, Mayple

Dear Santa,
I am in 2nd grade at 

L.E.S.. I will leave you 
milk and cookies. Am I 
on the naughty list? How 
is Dasher and the other 
reindeer and elves? I am 
wishing for a King Kong 
Punching Kong toy, Mec-
ca King Kong toy, Mecca 
Godzilla Heat Breath toy, 
and Godzilla Heat Breath 
toy, please. Merry Christ-
mas! Ho Ho Ho
Love You, Ronin

Dear Santa,
I am in 2nd grade at 

L.E.S.. I will leave you 
milk and cookies. How 
are you doing? How many 
toys do the elves make? I 
am wishing for another 
doll. I am wishing for an-
other dog toy for my dog.
Thank You Santa, Emma

Dear Santa,
I like to play with Poke-

mon. I am in 2nd grade at 
L.E.S. and it is fun. How 
old are the reindeer? How 
many elves are in the 
North Pole? I am wish-
ing for a x-box, Dogman 
books, and a dirt bike.
Thank You,Weston

Dear Santa,
I like to watch Grey’s 

Anatomy. I am very help-
ful when Keith needs help. 
How old are you? How do 
you make the sleigh fly? I 
am wishing for an Apple 
watch, iphone 15, laptop, 
Bluetooth headphones, 
more Hooky books, and 
more cats, please. Merry 
Christmas!
Thank You, Addy

Dear Santa,
I love cookies. I love 

milk. How do the rein-
deer fly? How do you stay 
warm? Please bring me a 

Hoverboard. Please bring 
me a phone. Please bring 
me money.
Thank You, Luke

Dear Santa,
I love books. I love bak-

ing cookies. What hap-
pened to my elf on the 
shelf? How are the rein-
deer? I am wishing for a 
Nintendo Switch, a new 
pair of Nikes, and a new 
elf on the shelf next year. 
Merry Christmas!
Thank You, Jamison

Dear Santa,
I like the Chiefs. I am in 

2nd grade. What do you 
feed the reindeer? How 
many elves are there? I 
want the Lego Harry Pot-
ter train, a Lego Tracker, 
Legos, and books, please.
Thank You, Braxten

Dear Santa,
I like to play my PS5. 

I watch K-State. How 
many reindeer do you 
have? What is our favor-
ite movie? I want a mil-
lion dollars. I want Re-
ese’s.
Love, Axl

Dear Santa,
I am reading the Harry 

Potter books. I love to 
read! How old are you? 
Does Mrs. Claus knit 

Season’s Greetings from
Dr. Grant Heller

414 S. 6th • Lincoln, Kansas
(785) 524-4107

Susan Marshall,
Attorney at Law

145 E. Lincoln Ave. • Lincoln, Kansas
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G. Kyle Gwinner, 
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Lucas-Sylvan Kindergarten and 1st Grade
Letters to Santa

Mrs. Wehrman’s 
Kindergarten Class

Dear Santa:  I want a 
Barbie Dream House for 
Christmas.  My brother 
would like a Monster Jam.  
I want to get him two, one 
for his birthday and one for 
Christmas, because I love 
my brother and he loves 
me.  Can you send Krystal 
my elf back for Christmas 
because I like her?   Thank 
You Santa!  
Love, Weiland Wray

Dear Santa:  I want a Rub-
ble Family from Paw Patrol 
for Christmas.  I also want 
a toy monster truck.  How 
do you get all the presents 
delivered before the morn-
ing?  I love you!                     
Love, Ryan Naegele

Dear Santa:  I want a new 
Skipper Barbie for Christ-
mas.  I also want clothes 
for her.  I like you because 
you bring us new toys.  
Love, Corrighan Sole

Dear Santa:  I want a new 
Tablet for Christmas.  I 
want all kinds of games for 
my Tablet.  I want rainbow 
games and color games.  
Your reindeer are so cool!  
I like that you fly with 
them.       

Love, Emmett Otten

Dear Santa:  I want a 
Watch that I can call my 
mom with.  I also want to 
watch you tube on it.   I 
want an elf named Hunter.  
I love you Santa!  I love 
that you give presents!  
Love, Hudson Raile

Dear Santa:  I want a red 
jeep that is like my white 
jeep.  I want a real puppy 
like Clifford, but alive!  Do 
you know how the Grinch 
makes his home?  Do you 
both live in caves?  I love 
you!  
Love, Ryker Bradshaw

Dear Santa:  I want a real 
unicorn called Wild Star.  
She is a girl that makes 
rainbows.  I also want a 
pretend unicorn like Wild 
Star.  I like you Santa be-
cause you are the best be-
cause you bring toys!  
Love, Macy Emmons

Dear Santa:  I want two 
real elves for Christmas.  I 
want a big white jeep with 
a trailer so I can put some 
animals on it.  I also want 
toy reindeer because I like 
your reindeer.  You are 
good!       
Love, Mason Sulsar

Dear Santa:  I want twin 
baby dolls who cry and 
laugh and have two bottles.  
I want to see your sled.  
What do your reindeer eat?  
Last year, I set out carrots 
at Christmas for them.  I 
love you Santa!   
Love, Raelyn Naegele

Dear Santa:  I want a big 
monster truck chase thing!  
It is blue with big wheels 
and has a claw.  I want a 
big drum set.  I will give 
you cookies at Christmas.  
I feel happy about what I 
want for Christmas.  
Love, Kooper Cain

Dear Santa:  I would like 
a Gruffalo and a dragon fly 
for Christmas.  I also want 
some new books.  Thank 
you Santa!  
Love, Andrew Garland

Mrs. Labertew’s 
1st Graders
(With kid spelling/gram-

mar and a little explana-
tion in parentheses if need-
ed!)

Dear Santa,
How are you? How are 

your reindeer doing? What 
are your favorite cind of 
cookies. 
Your Friend, Kambri M. 

USD #299
Sylvan-Lucas Unified Schools wish you

and yours a happy holiday!

Insurance Smart
Ethan Kuhlmann, Agent

Luray (785) 698-2272
Lucas (785) 525-6415

Meyer Tire & Lube
K-18 & K-14 • Lincoln, Kansas

(785) 524-4480

Parsons Funeral Home - 
Hall  Chapel 

111 E. Elm St. - Lincoln, Kansas
785.524.4549

hallchapel.com

432 Elm Street • Natoma, KS
1-877-885-1050 • angelcook.net

Dear Santa,
Hi Santa my name is Alex  

I Like your presnts. I wut 
all your presnts for me! I 
will lev a presnts for you!
Your Friend, Alex K. 

Dear Santa,
I want 20 rme (army) 

men. I want binosrs (dino-
saurs) for my babe bruthr. 
Are u rel?! Where do wou 
get hte presents?
Your Friend, Karsun G. 

Dear Santa,
How are You? I want 

poinsettia. I want gift. I 
want lights. I want Santa 
Claus. I want bell. 
Your Friend, Aryelle W. 

Dear Santa,
I would like a dog. A real 

one. My mom sid no. I like 
Rudolph Santa Claus. Tree. 
Wrapping paper. 
Your Friend, Matthew W. 

Dear Santa,
I want a box fo make up. 

Dear Santa How or the 
reindeer doing. I like you. 
You or kiind. 
Your Friend, Charlotte D. 

Dear Santa,
I wt (want) for a pet lisrd. 

(lizard). Mlc (milk) and 
Cuges (cookies) wil be left. 

Your Friend, Liam B.

Dear Santa,
Four christmas I want a 

bow and allso I want a nut-
cracker allso I want make 
up and allso I want a fish 
not a reoll (real) fish but a 
fish woo (would) be good 
four me but I dot,  have a 
fish tanck so four christmas 
i sour (should) get one four 
christmas. 
Your Friend, Alice M. 

Dear Santa,
I wood like too know how 

Rudolph  is boing? I wood 
like a RC smitruck. 
Your Friend, Emerson H. 

Dear Santa,
how is rudolph is she 

good or bad. 
Your Friend, Andrew B. 

Dear Santa,
Can I please have a stuff 

animal dog. You can take 
my cast off. I wanna walk 
and itch my leg. 
Your Friend, Ryver R. 
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Lucas-Sylvan Second & Third Grade Letters to Santa
Mrs. Cain’s 
Second Grade Class

Dear Santa,
This year, I have been 

very nice. One thing that I 
did that was extra nice was: 
change my Brother diaper I 
would love for you to bring 
me: LOLS, a uncorn egg, I 
want to see Elves
Love, Keni

Dear Santa, 
This year, I have been 

very nice. One thing that I 
did that was extra nice was: 
play nicely with my little 
brother. I would love for 
you to bring me: Super Ma-
rio toys, Legos, and build.
Love, Mox

Dear Santa,
I have tried to be good. Is 

Santa good at Christmas? I 
want a basket ball hopp and 
a ball. I hope I get gifts and 
I hope I get a VR and an RC 
car
Sincerely, Tanner

Dear Santa,
I thank I have been good 

this year. I hope I’m on the 
good list How many cook-
ies do you want? I think I 
want a phone Christmas and 
my outlets to work. Thank 
you Santa!
Sincerely, Kimberly

Dear Santa,
I tried to be good this year. 

I want a Dr. Doom lego 
Mini figure and would like 
lego T-Rex. I also would 
want a Dr. Strange and a Ju-
rassic lego set. Last but not 
least a lego hella carrier set.
Sincerley, Elijah

Dear Santa,
This year, I have been very 

nice. One things that I did 
that was extra nice was: 
give my mom a gift I would 
love for you to bring me: a 
skateboard for Christmas.
Love, Max

Dear Santa,
This year, I have been 

very nice. One thing that I 
did that was extra nice was: 
I helped my mom and dad 
with supper. I would love 
for you to bring me: a Bar-
bie doll house with accesso-
ries! And a camera!
Love, Brooklyn

Dear Santa,
I have been really good 

this year. I hope you like 
the cookies I made this year. 
I hope you have a Merry 
Christmas. This year I want 
a Polaroid Camera.
Sincerely, Amber

Dear Santa,
I am trying to be nice. For 

Christmas I would like a 
vanity. How many cook-
ies do you want? Do you 
like milk or cookies more? 
I would also like a skate 
boad. Mary Christmas!!
Sincerely, Lauren

Dear Santa,
How are you this year? For 

Christmas I would like the 
Legend of Zelda Echoes of 
Wisdom Nintendo game 
card and a hedgehog stuffie. 
I would also like a volcano 
lava lamp. A Christmas 
blanket would be nice and 
a notebook with stuff paper 
would make me gratful
Sincerely,
Archer

Dear Santa,
This year, I have been 

very nice. One thing that I 
did that was extra nice was: 
helping my friends when 
they fall in the grass while 
playing soccer. I would love 
for you to bring me: 8S bat-
ter rc car please and thank 
you. 
Love, Nash

Dear Santa,
This year, I have been very 

nice. One thing that I did 
that was extra nice was: I 
helped my fiends play soc-
cer. I would love for you to 
bring me: a football, a Lego 
kit, and a Lego box.
Love, Aiden

Dear Santa,
This year, I have been very 

nice. One thing that I did 
that was extra nice was: I 
helped an old lady acros 
the road. I would love for 
you to bring me: makup kit, 
scoole kit, a Barbie house 
(not a real one), a colloring 
book, and acrylic markers.
Love and Adore, Westlyn

Dear Santa,
This year, I have been 

very nice. One thing that I 
did that was extra nice was: 
helping my mom clean 
dishes. I would love for 
you to bring me a Chiefs 
helmet signed by ALL the 
football players.
Love, Slade

Mrs Scott’s 
Second Grade Class

Dear Santa,
My name is Isabelle Mc-

Clanahan, and I am 9 years 
old. This year I have been 
very good. For Christmas, 
please bring me heels and a 
crown, a phone and gloves, 
and a new dress.
Thank you, Santa.
 
Dear Santa,
My name is Samuel Chris-

tianson, and I am 9 years 
old. This year I have been 
very good. For Christ-
mas, please bring me Hot 
Wheels, tractor toys, farm 
toys, a drawing pad, and a 
laptop.
Thank you, Santa.
 
Dear Santa,
My name is Hunter Koehn, 

and I am 9 years old. This 
year I have been very good. 
For Christmas, please bring 
me a Lego set, a weight set, 

and please bring me a bunch 
of money.
Thank you, Santa.
 
Dear Santa,
My name is Markas Green, 

and I am 8 years old. This 
year I have been fairly good. 
For Christmas, please bring 
me a tablet, new shoes, new 
socks, an Air Soft gun, and 
new boots for my dad.
Thank you, Santa.
 
 Dear Santa,
My name is Lane Leon-

ard, and I am 8 years old. 
This year I have been fairly 
good. For Christmas, please 
bring me dirt bike gear, Air 
Soft bullets, Air Soft scope, 
Air Soft laser, and 2,999 Air 
Soft bullets.
Thank you, Santa.
 
Dear Santa,
My name is Tia Muel-

ler, and I am 9 years old. 
This year I have been fairly 
good. For Christmas, please 
bring me a new iphone 14, 
my own dog, and a soccer 
ball.
Thank you, Santa.
 
Dear Santa,
My name is Lane Metcalf, 

and I am 8 years old. This 
year I have been very good. 
For Christmas, please bring 
me a new saddle, a roping 
horse, a cross necklace, a 
new fishing pole, and Den-
ver Broncos 2 game ticket.
Thank you, Santa.
 
Dear Santa,
My name is Axel Schnei-

der, and I am 8 years old. 
This year I have been very 
good. For Christmas, please 

bring me a sling shot, pet 
deer, pet bald eagle, and a 
pet turkey.
Thank you, Santa.
 
Dear Santa,
My name is Cael Huehl, 

and I am 8 years old. This 
year I have been very good. 
For Christmas, please bring 
me Messi tickets for a game, 
1 million bucks, Pokemon 
cards, Mine coins, and 
Legos.
Thank you, Santa.
 
Dear Santa,
My name is Jasper Bue-

low, and I am 8 years old. 
This year I have been very 
good. For Christmas, please 
bring me Pokemon, Mine-
craft Roblox, mini Santa, 
makeup, and a million 
bucks.
Thank you, Santa.
 
Dear Santa,
My name is Kelvi Seeha-

fer, and I am 8 years old. 
This year I have been fairly 
good. For Christmas, please 
bring me a trained chocolate 
lab to stay by me and help 
me work cows, iphone 15, 
people in the world to not be 
sick, AirPods, and a watch.
Thank you, Santa.
 
Dear Santa,
My name is Isai De Lira, 

and I am 8 years old. This 
year I have been fairly 
good. For Christmas, please 
bring me little robots called 
Emo, Ellick, and Vector, 
some dog toys for Oreo, and 
some money to survive.
Thank you, Santa.
 
 Dear Santa,

My name is J.D. Mettlen, 
and I am 9 years old. This 
year I have been very good. 
For Christmas, please bring 
me My Hero Academia 
stuff and Pokemon stuff, 
give my elf pet Polar Bear 
some magic, Greek mytho-
goly wegons, and for every-
one to have a good Christ-
mas.
Thank you, Santa.
 
Dear Santa,
My name is Logan McCla-

nahan, and I am 9 years old. 
This year I have been very 
good. For Christmas, please 
bring me a monster truck, 
an iphone 14 pro, a plane 
drone, a parachute, and a 
kid size racecar.
Thank you, Santa.
 
Dear Santa,
My name is Reid Meitler, 

and I am 9 years old. This 
year I have been very good. 
For Christmas, please bring 
me a Patrick Mahomes 
necklace, Travis Kelce 
necklace, and a bait caster.
Thank you, Santa.
 
Dear Santa,
My name is Bentley Zach-

go, and I am 8 years old. 
This year I have been very 
good. For Christmas, please 
bring me a gold necklace, 
farm toys, an iphone 12, Air 
Soft gun, and a football.
Thank you, Santa.
 

 
Dear Santa,
My name is Landen Be-

atty, and I am 9 years old. 
This year I have been very 
good. For Christmas, please 
bring me new shoes, new 
socks, money, a guinea pig, 
and a new train.
Thank you, Santa.
 
Dear Santa,
My name is Leon Luallin, 

and I am 8 years old. This 
year I have been fairly good. 
For Christmas, please bring 
me $10,000. I also want 
wars to stop happening 
right now, please? I want 
Mrs. Keller’s family to stop 
dying right now. I also want 
AirPods and a watch.
Thank you, Santa.
 
Dear Santa,
My name is Jacob Kratky, 

and I am 8 years old. This 
year I have been very good. 
For Christmas, please bring 
me a Chiefs ticket, football 
cards, a Nerf mini gun, an 
Air Soft gun, and to see my 
steer Buddy again.
Thank you, Santa.
 
Dear Santa,
My name is Nora Agler, 

and I am 8 years old. This 
year I have been very good. 
For Christmas, please bring 
me another real cat and 
books.
Thank you, Santa.

Merry Christmas!
Eric Frederking • 785-531-0612
Ron Frederking • 785-658-7223

FREDERKING SEED

Sylvan Sales
Commission, LLC

Sale Barn 785-526-7123
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Lucas-Sylvan Second & Third Grade Letters to Santa
Mrs. Cain’s 
Second Grade Class

Dear Santa,
This year, I have been 

very nice. One thing that I 
did that was extra nice was: 
change my Brother diaper I 
would love for you to bring 
me: LOLS, a uncorn egg, I 
want to see Elves
Love, Keni

Dear Santa, 
This year, I have been 

very nice. One thing that I 
did that was extra nice was: 
play nicely with my little 
brother. I would love for 
you to bring me: Super Ma-
rio toys, Legos, and build.
Love, Mox

Dear Santa,
I have tried to be good. Is 

Santa good at Christmas? I 
want a basket ball hopp and 
a ball. I hope I get gifts and 
I hope I get a VR and an RC 
car
Sincerely, Tanner

Dear Santa,
I thank I have been good 

this year. I hope I’m on the 
good list How many cook-
ies do you want? I think I 
want a phone Christmas and 
my outlets to work. Thank 
you Santa!
Sincerely, Kimberly

Dear Santa,
I tried to be good this year. 

I want a Dr. Doom lego 
Mini figure and would like 
lego T-Rex. I also would 
want a Dr. Strange and a Ju-
rassic lego set. Last but not 
least a lego hella carrier set.
Sincerley, Elijah

Dear Santa,
This year, I have been very 

nice. One things that I did 
that was extra nice was: 
give my mom a gift I would 
love for you to bring me: a 
skateboard for Christmas.
Love, Max

Dear Santa,
This year, I have been 

very nice. One thing that I 
did that was extra nice was: 
I helped my mom and dad 
with supper. I would love 
for you to bring me: a Bar-
bie doll house with accesso-
ries! And a camera!
Love, Brooklyn

Dear Santa,
I have been really good 

this year. I hope you like 
the cookies I made this year. 
I hope you have a Merry 
Christmas. This year I want 
a Polaroid Camera.
Sincerely, Amber

Dear Santa,
I am trying to be nice. For 

Christmas I would like a 
vanity. How many cook-
ies do you want? Do you 
like milk or cookies more? 
I would also like a skate 
boad. Mary Christmas!!
Sincerely, Lauren

Dear Santa,
How are you this year? For 

Christmas I would like the 
Legend of Zelda Echoes of 
Wisdom Nintendo game 
card and a hedgehog stuffie. 
I would also like a volcano 
lava lamp. A Christmas 
blanket would be nice and 
a notebook with stuff paper 
would make me gratful
Sincerely,
Archer

Dear Santa,
This year, I have been 

very nice. One thing that I 
did that was extra nice was: 
helping my friends when 
they fall in the grass while 
playing soccer. I would love 
for you to bring me: 8S bat-
ter rc car please and thank 
you. 
Love, Nash

Dear Santa,
This year, I have been very 

nice. One thing that I did 
that was extra nice was: I 
helped my fiends play soc-
cer. I would love for you to 
bring me: a football, a Lego 
kit, and a Lego box.
Love, Aiden

Dear Santa,
This year, I have been very 

nice. One thing that I did 
that was extra nice was: I 
helped an old lady acros 
the road. I would love for 
you to bring me: makup kit, 
scoole kit, a Barbie house 
(not a real one), a colloring 
book, and acrylic markers.
Love and Adore, Westlyn

Dear Santa,
This year, I have been 

very nice. One thing that I 
did that was extra nice was: 
helping my mom clean 
dishes. I would love for 
you to bring me a Chiefs 
helmet signed by ALL the 
football players.
Love, Slade

Mrs Scott’s 
Second Grade Class

Dear Santa,
My name is Isabelle Mc-

Clanahan, and I am 9 years 
old. This year I have been 
very good. For Christmas, 
please bring me heels and a 
crown, a phone and gloves, 
and a new dress.
Thank you, Santa.
 
Dear Santa,
My name is Samuel Chris-

tianson, and I am 9 years 
old. This year I have been 
very good. For Christ-
mas, please bring me Hot 
Wheels, tractor toys, farm 
toys, a drawing pad, and a 
laptop.
Thank you, Santa.
 
Dear Santa,
My name is Hunter Koehn, 

and I am 9 years old. This 
year I have been very good. 
For Christmas, please bring 
me a Lego set, a weight set, 

and please bring me a bunch 
of money.
Thank you, Santa.
 
Dear Santa,
My name is Markas Green, 

and I am 8 years old. This 
year I have been fairly good. 
For Christmas, please bring 
me a tablet, new shoes, new 
socks, an Air Soft gun, and 
new boots for my dad.
Thank you, Santa.
 
 Dear Santa,
My name is Lane Leon-

ard, and I am 8 years old. 
This year I have been fairly 
good. For Christmas, please 
bring me dirt bike gear, Air 
Soft bullets, Air Soft scope, 
Air Soft laser, and 2,999 Air 
Soft bullets.
Thank you, Santa.
 
Dear Santa,
My name is Tia Muel-

ler, and I am 9 years old. 
This year I have been fairly 
good. For Christmas, please 
bring me a new iphone 14, 
my own dog, and a soccer 
ball.
Thank you, Santa.
 
Dear Santa,
My name is Lane Metcalf, 

and I am 8 years old. This 
year I have been very good. 
For Christmas, please bring 
me a new saddle, a roping 
horse, a cross necklace, a 
new fishing pole, and Den-
ver Broncos 2 game ticket.
Thank you, Santa.
 
Dear Santa,
My name is Axel Schnei-

der, and I am 8 years old. 
This year I have been very 
good. For Christmas, please 

bring me a sling shot, pet 
deer, pet bald eagle, and a 
pet turkey.
Thank you, Santa.
 
Dear Santa,
My name is Cael Huehl, 

and I am 8 years old. This 
year I have been very good. 
For Christmas, please bring 
me Messi tickets for a game, 
1 million bucks, Pokemon 
cards, Mine coins, and 
Legos.
Thank you, Santa.
 
Dear Santa,
My name is Jasper Bue-

low, and I am 8 years old. 
This year I have been very 
good. For Christmas, please 
bring me Pokemon, Mine-
craft Roblox, mini Santa, 
makeup, and a million 
bucks.
Thank you, Santa.
 
Dear Santa,
My name is Kelvi Seeha-

fer, and I am 8 years old. 
This year I have been fairly 
good. For Christmas, please 
bring me a trained chocolate 
lab to stay by me and help 
me work cows, iphone 15, 
people in the world to not be 
sick, AirPods, and a watch.
Thank you, Santa.
 
Dear Santa,
My name is Isai De Lira, 

and I am 8 years old. This 
year I have been fairly 
good. For Christmas, please 
bring me little robots called 
Emo, Ellick, and Vector, 
some dog toys for Oreo, and 
some money to survive.
Thank you, Santa.
 
 Dear Santa,

My name is J.D. Mettlen, 
and I am 9 years old. This 
year I have been very good. 
For Christmas, please bring 
me My Hero Academia 
stuff and Pokemon stuff, 
give my elf pet Polar Bear 
some magic, Greek mytho-
goly wegons, and for every-
one to have a good Christ-
mas.
Thank you, Santa.
 
Dear Santa,
My name is Logan McCla-

nahan, and I am 9 years old. 
This year I have been very 
good. For Christmas, please 
bring me a monster truck, 
an iphone 14 pro, a plane 
drone, a parachute, and a 
kid size racecar.
Thank you, Santa.
 
Dear Santa,
My name is Reid Meitler, 

and I am 9 years old. This 
year I have been very good. 
For Christmas, please bring 
me a Patrick Mahomes 
necklace, Travis Kelce 
necklace, and a bait caster.
Thank you, Santa.
 
Dear Santa,
My name is Bentley Zach-

go, and I am 8 years old. 
This year I have been very 
good. For Christmas, please 
bring me a gold necklace, 
farm toys, an iphone 12, Air 
Soft gun, and a football.
Thank you, Santa.
 

 
Dear Santa,
My name is Landen Be-

atty, and I am 9 years old. 
This year I have been very 
good. For Christmas, please 
bring me new shoes, new 
socks, money, a guinea pig, 
and a new train.
Thank you, Santa.
 
Dear Santa,
My name is Leon Luallin, 

and I am 8 years old. This 
year I have been fairly good. 
For Christmas, please bring 
me $10,000. I also want 
wars to stop happening 
right now, please? I want 
Mrs. Keller’s family to stop 
dying right now. I also want 
AirPods and a watch.
Thank you, Santa.
 
Dear Santa,
My name is Jacob Kratky, 

and I am 8 years old. This 
year I have been very good. 
For Christmas, please bring 
me a Chiefs ticket, football 
cards, a Nerf mini gun, an 
Air Soft gun, and to see my 
steer Buddy again.
Thank you, Santa.
 
Dear Santa,
My name is Nora Agler, 

and I am 8 years old. This 
year I have been very good. 
For Christmas, please bring 
me another real cat and 
books.
Thank you, Santa.

Merry Christmas!
Eric Frederking • 785-531-0612
Ron Frederking • 785-658-7223

FREDERKING SEED

Sylvan Sales
Commission, LLC

Sale Barn 785-526-7123
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Tescott Kindergarten & First Grade Letters to Santa
Mrs. Curtis’s
Kindergarten Class

Dear Santa
My dad cod my elf on the 

sel(shelf).  He tod Max wht 
I wut for Crsms.  I luv you.
Luv Keation

Dear Santa
Hw is the wathr (weather) 

at the Noth Pol?  I wnt a toe 
remot control car.  I hop I 
git a moster trck.  Hop you 
hav a nic Crimas.
Love Zayden

Dear Santa
I want a Princess Fife.
Luv Hazel

Dear Santa
Ho r u?  I wnt a toy dril.  I 

wold also like a plantr.
Love Kai

Dear Santa
Hw r the rander?  I wnt an 

ic crem makr.  I wnt a 
motrsil .(motorcycle)
I wnt a puzl of spidrman.  

I will hav cokes (cookies) 
for you.
I luv you.
Luv Aaron

Dear Santa
Hw iz Mrs. Claz?  Wil 

you giv me an electrik  drt 
bik? I wld also like a 
roking(rocking)  chr(chair) 
reclinr (recliner).  I wld 

also like nuw snw bots.
Love Zander

Dear Santa
I lov u.  I wnt shus like 

Emery.  I hav ben good.
Zachary

Dear Santa
I wut a naw drt bik for 

cismis.  I wil have cokes 
(cookies) for you.
Love Emery

Dear Santa

I hop you are having a 
goud yer.  I wnt a reel 
fhon(phone) for Crismas.  I 
wood lik a motersicle (mo-
torcyle) for Crismas.
Love Riyder

Mrs. Macy’s
First Grade Class

Deer Santa,
How is Mrs. Clos? This 

year I am working hard 
at basckit ball. For Cris-
mas pleas can I get a bike? 

Have a mare Crismas!
Love, Layla

Deer Santa,
How are you doing? This 

year I am working hard at 
listening. For Chrismas 
this year I wunt a par uv 
kitten sliprs. I wish you a 
mare Chrismas. 
Love, Johnna

Deer Santu,
How is the reindeer? This 

year I am workin hard at 
dance. For christmas can I 
ples have a fake cat? Than-
ke you santu. 

Love, Taylor 

Deer Santa Clos,
How ms. Clos doing? 

This yer I am werking hrd 
at school. For Christmas 
can I ples hav a toy? I wish 
you a vry marre Christmas.
Love, Cohen 

Deer Santa Close,
How are the elfs? This 

year I am working hard 
at baseball. This year for 
crismis I want some more 
baseballs. I hope you have 
a mary crismis.
Love,  Bentley

Deckert & Sons Trucking, Inc.
Tescott, Kansas
785-488-7906

120 S. Santa Fe • Salina, Kan. • 785-820-8161
pathway-financial.com

State Farm Insurance
Anthony Hopkins Agency
231 N. Douglas, Ellsworth, KS

785-472-4426
117 E. Lincoln Ave. • Lincoln, Kansas

(785) 524-4849
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600 S Santa Fe, Salina • (785) 825-1621  I  2040 S Ohio, Salina • (785) 452-9975
101 E Lincoln, Lincoln • (785) 524-4458  I  104 S Main, Tescott • (785) 283-4217

202 N Main, Lindsborg • (785) 227-8830  I    www.bankoftescott.com



SeaSon’S GreetinGSSeaSon’S GreetinGS December 18, 2024 - Page 8December 18, 2024 - Page 8LincoLn SentineLchriStmaS greetingSLincoLn SentineLchriStmaS greetingS

Viv’s RetailViv’s Retail
LiquorLiquor

605 N 6th, 
lincoln, Ks785-524-4844

Tescott Second Grade Letters to Santa
Mrs. King’s 
Second Grade Class

Dear Santa,
How is Rudolph?  Plis ma 

I hav a PS5, a now clachrl, 
and a Iphon 16 and Call 
of duty black opps 6 and a 

TV.
Love, Liam

Dear Santa,
Santa I hope your hav-

ing fun in the north pole.  
I wish I could get a new 
phone I need more sweat 

pants I need more gloves, 
shirts, socks, and coats.
Love, Ryker

Dear Santa,
I would like FS19 and 

FS25 pls How is Mrs. 
Claus and can I have a PS4 
control I will leav candies 

Family Hair Flair
(785) 283-4360

Rhonda, Rosie, Cortney, Evangel, and Angela 
wish you all a very Merry Christmas!

C & S Service
105 W. 1st • Tescott, Kansas

(785) 283-4699

Tescott Schools
wish you a happy holiday!

Deckert & Sons Trucking, Inc.
Tescott, Kansas
785-488-7906

Tara M Kubick, Agent
http://agenttarakubick.com

and milk and for Rudolph i 
will leav carrots
Love, Brayden

Dear Santa,
Why are you plees can I 

get a phon neglis?
Love, Zoey

Dear Santa, 
haloru are you I wunt a 

for wil griv tractor.  and 
a simi and jipe. and a red 
pete. and a hotrod car. and 
silage trailer.
Love, Toby

Dear Santa,

How are you I want mer-
maid tel and a sum make-
up.
Love, Adalyn

Dear Santa,
how or you? I need socks 

and a coat.  I want a amck-
in grl doll.
Love, Naleeciah


